
2006-101 ITB Chemicals for WWTP                      
Bids due March 29, 2006 Brenntag Columbia Cascade Rhodia Univar

Chemical #1
Sodium Hypochlorite
Pumped into 350 gallon tank
Price per gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.25
Cost per order - 350 gallons $1,137.50
Delivery charge per order $35.00

Chemical #2
Sodium Hypochlorite
55-Gallon drums
Price per gallon $2.30 $1.50 No Bid $2.20
Cost per order - (2) each 55-gallon drums $243.80 $150.00 *$233.20
Delivery charge per order $67.50 $100.00 $35.00

*53 Gallon Drum *53 Gallon Drum

Chemical #3
Sodium Hydroxide
Pumped into 270 gal or 5,400 gal tank
Price per pound (lb) No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.5850
Number of lbs per gallon $12.71
Cost per order - 270 gallons $157.95
Delivery charge per order $35.00

Chemical #4
Sodium Bisulfite
Pumped into 270 gallon tank
Price per pound (lb) No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.6195
Number of lbs per gallon $11.04
Cost per order - 270 gallons $167.27
Delivery charge per order $35.00



2006-101 ITB Chemicals for WWTP                      
Bids due March 29, 2006 Brenntag Columbia Cascade Rhodia Univar

Chemical #5
Citric Acid
50 Lb Bags
Price per pound (lb) $0.60 $0.61 No Bid $0.59
Number of bags per pallet 40 x 50 Lb Bags 40 Bags 44 Bags
Cost per order - (1) pallet $1,200.00 $1,220.00 $1,298.00
Delivery charge per order $67.50 $100.00 $35.00

Chemical #6
Aluminum Sulfate
4,000 Gallon delivery pumped into 8,000 gal tank
Price per dry ton $340.00 $339.00 $380.34 $351.00
Number of gallons per dry ton 4000 Gal = 10.5 Dry Ton 4364 Gal = 11.52 Dry Ton 381.59 87 Gallons
Cost per order - 4,000 gallons $3,570.00 $3,579.84 Approx $4,000 $3,802.27
Delivery charge per order $150.00 Delivered Included Included

Chemical #7
Calcium Hypochlorite
Price per pound (lb) No Bid $1.63 No Bid $1.47
Cost per order - 100 lbs $163.00 $147.00
Delivery charge per order $100.00 * $35.00

*Can be combined w/Sodium 
Hypochlorite



CITY OF ASHLAND 
 CONTRACT FOR PURCHASE OF GOODS AND SERVICES 
 
 
Contract made this      12th   day of   April    , 2006, between the City of Ashland ("City")  
and   CASCADE COLUMBIA DIST. CO.         ("Contractor").     
 
City and Contractor agree: 
 
1. Contract Documents: This contract is made as a result of an Invitation to Bid issued by City 
entitled "INVITATION TO BID" for   CHEMICALS FOR THE WASTEWATER TREATMENT 
PLANT, Bid No. #2006-101. Contractor was awarded the bid as the lowest responsible bidder  
on   04/12/2006 .  In the event of any inconsistencies in the terms of this contract, the 
contract documents defined in the invitation to bid and Contractor's bid, this contract shall take 
precedence over the contract documents which shall take precedence over the bid.   
 
2. Scope:  Contractor shall produce and deliver the goods and services described in the 
contract documents within the time prescribed in the contract documents. The following 
exceptions, alterations or modifications to the contract documents are incorporated into this 
contract:  
 
3. Price and Payment: City shall pay Contractor the following prices for the following chemicals: 
 
Chemical #2 Sodium Hypochlorite $1.50/Gallon 
Estimated usage – March to November: 900 Gallons, Total estimated cost $1,350.00 
Delivery charge per order $100.00 
 
Chemical #6 Aluminum Sulfate  $339.00/Dry Ton 
Estimated usage – March to November: 80,000 Gallons, 379 Gallons/Dry Ton, 
Total estimated cost $71,559.51, Price per dry ton includes delivery charge     
 
4.  This contract may be cancelled by either party with 30-days written notice. 
 
 
CORPORATE OFFICER          CITY OF ASHLAND 
 
BY                                                   BY                     
  Signature     Lee Tuneberg 
        Finance Director 
                
  Print Name 
 REVIEWED AS TO CONTENT: 
Title:                                                      
   BY          
            Department Head 
Fed ID #    Date      
 
 Coding      

Purchase Order                 
                                

 
Page 1 of 1, CONTRACT 



CITY OF ASHLAND 
 CONTRACT FOR PURCHASE OF GOODS AND SERVICES 
 
Contract made this      12th   day of   April    , 2006, between the City of Ashland ("City")  
and  UNIVAR USA         ("Contractor").     
 
City and Contractor agree: 
 
1. Contract Documents: This contract is made as a result of an Invitation to Bid issued by City 
entitled "INVITATION TO BID" for   CHEMICALS FOR THE WASTEWATER TREATMENT 
PLANT, Bid No. #2006-101. Contractor was awarded the bid as the lowest responsible bidder  
on   04/12/2006 .  In the event of any inconsistencies in the terms of this contract, the 
contract documents defined in the invitation to bid and Contractor's bid, this contract shall take 
precedence over the contract documents which shall take precedence over the bid.   
 
2. Scope:  Contractor shall produce and deliver the goods and services described in the 
contract documents within the time prescribed in the contract documents. The following 
exceptions, alterations or modifications to the contract documents are incorporated into this 
contract:  
 
3. Price and Payment: City shall pay Contractor the following amounts for the following 
chemicals:  
 
Chemical #1 Sodium Hypochlorite $3.25/Gallon 
Estimated usage – March to November: 1,200 Gallons, Total estimated cost $3,900.00 
Delivery charge per order $35.00 
Chemical #3 Sodium Hydroxide  $0.5850/Lb 
Estimated usage – March to November: 12,800 Lbs, Total estimated cost $7,488.00 
Chemical #4 Sodium Bisulfite  $0.6195/Lb 
Estimated usage – March to November: 17,000 Lbs, Total estimated cost $10,531.50 
Delivery charge per order $35.00 
Chemical #5 Citric Acid   $0.59/Lb 
Estimated usage – March to November: 6,600 Lbs, Total estimated cost $3,894.00 
Delivery charge per order $35.00 
Chemical #7 Calcium Hypochlorite $1.47/Lb 
Estimated usage – March to November: 1,200 Lbs, Total estimated cost $1,764.00 
Delivery charge per order $35.00 
  
4.  This contract may be cancelled by either party with 30-days written notice. 
 
CORPORATE OFFICER          CITY OF ASHLAND 
 
BY                                                   BY                     
  Signature     Lee Tuneberg 
        Finance Director 
              
  Print Name 
 REVIEWED AS TO CONTENT: 
Title:                                                      
   BY          
            Department Head 
Fed ID #    Date      
 
 Coding      

Purchase Order                
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